
County of Volusia, FL Recommendation of Award
Solicitation # and Title: 24-B-61LS Bulk Fuel

Solicitation Closing Date and Time: March 19, 2024, 3:00 PM
Large Loads OPIS Low and Average

Unit of 
Measure

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding OPIS 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

OPIS Low 
History

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

GAL 0.0884 2.8078 0.0584 2.8702 No Bid No Bid 0.1775 2.8969 0.0952 2.9070

GAL 0.0988 2.3499 0.0688 2.4028 No Bid No Bid 0.1873 2.4384 0.1046 2.4386

GAL 0.0934 2.8180 0.0634 2.8779 No Bid No Bid 0.1758 2.9004 0.0968 2.9113

History Total 7.9758 8.1509 8.2358 8.2569

Split Load 50.0000 50.0000 50.0000 50.0000
Devide by 8000 Gallons 0.0063 0.0063 0.0063 0.0063
History Total 7.9820 8.1572 8.2421 8.2632

Above Ground 70.0000 70.0000 0.0000 0.0000
Devide by 8000 Gallons 0.0088 0.0088 0.0000 0.0000
History Total 7.9845 8.1597 8.2358 8.2569

Opis low On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.1022 2.3437 3.1072 Opened by: Tabatha Freedman, Senior Procurement Analyst
May-23 2.5968 2.3290 2.6025 Witnessed by: Lisa Smith, Procurement Analyst II
Jun-23 2.5709 2.3070 2.5763 Date Posted: March 26, 2024
Jul-23 2.6983 2.4688 2.7033 County Council Date: April 16, 2024
Dec-23 2.6270 1.9722 2.6322 Recommendation of Award (ROA) for Large Loads OPIS Low and Average:
Jan-24 2.7212 2.0861 2.7262 James River Solutions, Palmdale Oil Company, Sunoco
Average 2.7194 2.2511 2.7246 Recommendation of Award (ROA) for Small Loads OPIS Low and Average:

Gentry Oil, LLC, Greens Energy, Palmdale Oil Company
Opis 
Average 

On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.2308 2.4026 3.2306
May-23 2.6669 2.3952 2.6724
Jun-23 2.6835 2.3684 2.6906 Approved by: _______________________________________
Jul-23 2.7753 2.5353 2.7753 Pamela Wilsky, NIGP-CPP, CPPB, CPPO
Dec-23 2.6967 2.1042 2.6990 Director of Purchasing and Contracts

Jan-24 2.8177 2.1985 2.8190
Average 2.8118 2.3340 2.8145

Price 
Ranking 1 2 3

1

5 Gross No.2 Red-Dyed Fuel 
(Off Road) +/= 7500 gallons

3 E-10 Fuel +/= to 8000 
gallons

Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel
+/= 7500

ll

Gentry Oil, LLC

Line Item Fuel Type

Colonial Oil Industries, Inc. Global Montello Group Corp.
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County of Volusia, FL Recommendation of Award
Solicitation # and Title: 24-B-61LS Bulk Fuel

Solicitation Closing Date and Time: March 19, 2024, 3:00 PM
Large Loads OPIS Low and Average

Unit of 
Measure

GAL

GAL

GAL

History Total

Split Load
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Above Ground
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Opis low On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.1022 2.3437 3.1072
May-23 2.5968 2.3290 2.6025
Jun-23 2.5709 2.3070 2.5763
Jul-23 2.6983 2.4688 2.7033
Dec-23 2.6270 1.9722 2.6322
Jan-24 2.7212 2.0861 2.7262
Average 2.7194 2.2511 2.7246

Opis 
Average 

On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.2308 2.4026 3.2306
May-23 2.6669 2.3952 2.6724
Jun-23 2.6835 2.3684 2.6906
Jul-23 2.7753 2.5353 2.7753
Dec-23 2.6967 2.1042 2.6990

Jan-24 2.8177 2.1985 2.8190
Average 2.8118 2.3340 2.8145

Price 
Ranking 1 2 3

1

5 Gross No.2 Red-Dyed Fuel 
(Off Road) +/= 7500 gallons

3 E-10 Fuel +/= to 8000 
gallons

Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel
+/= 7500

ll

Line Item Fuel Type Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

OPIS Low 
History

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

OPIS Low 
History

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

OPIS Low 
History

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

0.1000 2.8194 0.0600 2.8718 0.0650 2.7844 0.0365 2.8483 2.8894 0.0800 2.8918

0.1000 2.3511 0.0600 2.3940 0.0650 2.3161 0.0225 2.3565 2.4211 0.0800 2.4140

0.1000 2.8246 0.0600 2.8745 0.0750 2.7996 0.0320 2.8465 2.8946 0.0800 2.8945

7.9952 8.1403 7.9002 8.0513 8.2052 8.2003

0.0000 0.0000 40.0000 40.0000 0.0100 0.0100
0.0050 0.0050

7.9952 8.1403 7.9052 8.0563 8.2052 8.2003

0.0000 0.0000 50.0000 50.0000 0.0000 0.0000
0.0000 0.0000 0.0063 0.0063 0.0000 0.0000
7.9952 8.1403 7.9065 8.0576 8.2052 8.2003

0.1700

0.1700

0.1700

Lynch Oil

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

James River SolutionsGreens Energy
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County of Volusia, FL Recommendation of Award
Solicitation # and Title: 24-B-61LS Bulk Fuel

Solicitation Closing Date and Time: March 19, 2024, 3:00 PM
Large Loads OPIS Low and Average

Unit of 
Measure

GAL

GAL

GAL

History Total

Split Load
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Above Ground
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Opis low On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.1022 2.3437 3.1072
May-23 2.5968 2.3290 2.6025
Jun-23 2.5709 2.3070 2.5763
Jul-23 2.6983 2.4688 2.7033
Dec-23 2.6270 1.9722 2.6322
Jan-24 2.7212 2.0861 2.7262
Average 2.7194 2.2511 2.7246

Opis 
Average 

On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.2308 2.4026 3.2306
May-23 2.6669 2.3952 2.6724
Jun-23 2.6835 2.3684 2.6906
Jul-23 2.7753 2.5353 2.7753
Dec-23 2.6967 2.1042 2.6990

Jan-24 2.8177 2.1985 2.8190
Average 2.8118 2.3340 2.8145

Price 
Ranking 1 2 3

1

5 Gross No.2 Red-Dyed Fuel 
(Off Road) +/= 7500 gallons

3 E-10 Fuel +/= to 8000 
gallons

Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel
+/= 7500

ll

Line Item Fuel Type OPIS Low 
History

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

OPIS Low 
History

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

OPIS Low 
History

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

2.7957 0.0083 2.8201 0.0619 2.7813 0.0219 2.8337 0.0715 2.7909 (0.0076) 2.8042

2.3280 0.0059 2.3399 0.0569 2.3080 0.0169 2.3509 0.0689 2.3200 (0.0027) 2.3313

2.8042 0.0141 2.8286 0.0619 2.7865 0.0219 2.8364 0.0734 2.7980 (0.0007) 2.8138

7.9280 7.9886 7.8759 8.0210 7.9090 7.9493

50.0000 50.0000 0.0000 0.0000 75.0000 75.0000
0.0063 0.0063 0.0094 0.0094
7.9343 7.9949 7.8759 8.0210 7.9183 7.9587

70.0000 70.0000 0.0000 0.0000 100.0000 100.0000
0.0088 0.0088 0.0000 0.0000 0.0125 0.0125
7.9367 7.9974 7.8759 8.0210 7.9215 7.9618

0.0796

0.0763

0.0769

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, 
Inc

Petroleum Traders CorporationPalmdale Oil Company
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County of Volusia, FL Recommendation of Award
Solicitation # and Title: 24-B-61LS Bulk Fuel

Solicitation Closing Date and Time: March 19, 2024, 3:00 PM
Large Loads OPIS Low and Average

Unit of 
Measure

GAL

GAL

GAL

History Total

Split Load
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Above Ground
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Opis low On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.1022 2.3437 3.1072
May-23 2.5968 2.3290 2.6025
Jun-23 2.5709 2.3070 2.5763
Jul-23 2.6983 2.4688 2.7033
Dec-23 2.6270 1.9722 2.6322
Jan-24 2.7212 2.0861 2.7262
Average 2.7194 2.2511 2.7246

Opis 
Average 

On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.2308 2.4026 3.2306
May-23 2.6669 2.3952 2.6724
Jun-23 2.6835 2.3684 2.6906
Jul-23 2.7753 2.5353 2.7753
Dec-23 2.6967 2.1042 2.6990

Jan-24 2.8177 2.1985 2.8190
Average 2.8118 2.3340 2.8145

Price 
Ranking 1 2 3

1

5 Gross No.2 Red-Dyed Fuel 
(Off Road) +/= 7500 gallons

3 E-10 Fuel +/= to 8000 
gallons

Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel
+/= 7500

ll

Line Item Fuel Type Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

OPIS Low 
History

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

OPIS Low 
History

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

OPIS Low 
History

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

0.0677 2.7871 (0.0198) 2.7920 0.1238 2.8432 0.0623 2.8741 0.0579 2.7773 (0.0037) 2.8081

0.1219 2.3730 0.0112 2.3452 0.1018 2.3529 0.0423 2.3763 0.0501 2.3012 (0.0032) 2.3308

0.0592 2.7838 (0.0250) 2.7895 0.1238 2.8484 0.0623 2.8768 0.0579 2.7825 (0.0037) 2.8108

7.9440 7.9267 8.0446 8.1272 7.8611 7.9497

65.0000 65.0000 35.0000 35.0000 50.0000 50.0000
0.0081 0.0081 0.0044 0.0044 0.0063 0.0063
7.9521 7.9348 8.0489 8.1316 7.8674 7.9560

75.0000 75.0000 75.0000 75.0000 55.0000 55.0000
0.0094 0.0094 0.0094 0.0094 0.0069 0.0069
7.9533 7.9361 8.0540 8.1366 7.8679 7.9566

Sunoco, LLCSaratoga Rack Marketing LLCPinnacle Petroleum, Inc.
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County of Volusia, FL Recommendation of Award
Solicitation # and Title: 24-B-61LS Bulk Fuel

Solicitation Closing Date and Time: March 19, 2024, 3:00 PM
Large Loads OPIS Low and Average

Unit of 
Measure

GAL

GAL

GAL

History Total

Split Load
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Above Ground
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Opis low On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.1022 2.3437 3.1072
May-23 2.5968 2.3290 2.6025
Jun-23 2.5709 2.3070 2.5763
Jul-23 2.6983 2.4688 2.7033
Dec-23 2.6270 1.9722 2.6322
Jan-24 2.7212 2.0861 2.7262
Average 2.7194 2.2511 2.7246

Opis 
Average 

On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.2308 2.4026 3.2306
May-23 2.6669 2.3952 2.6724
Jun-23 2.6835 2.3684 2.6906
Jul-23 2.7753 2.5353 2.7753
Dec-23 2.6967 2.1042 2.6990

Jan-24 2.8177 2.1985 2.8190
Average 2.8118 2.3340 2.8145

Price 
Ranking 1 2 3

1

5 Gross No.2 Red-Dyed Fuel 
(Off Road) +/= 7500 gallons

3 E-10 Fuel +/= to 8000 
gallons

Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel
+/= 7500

ll

Line Item Fuel Type Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

OPIS Low 
History

Markup over 
OPIS daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

0.1200 2.8394 0.1000 2.9118

0.1200 2.3711 0.1000 2.4340

0.1200 2.8446 0.1000 2.9145

8.0552 8.260343

0.0000 0.0000

8.0552 8.2603

0.0000 0.0000
0.0000 0.0000
8.0552 8.2603

Tropic Oil Company
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County of Volusia, FL Recommendation of Award
Solicitation # and Title: 24-B-61LS Bulk Fuel

Solicitation Closing Date and Time: March 19, 2024, 3:00 PM
Small Loads OPIS Low and Average

Unit of 
Measure

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

GAL 0.3107 3.0301 0.2807 3.0925 0.1800 2.8994 0.1800 2.9918

GAL 0.3108 2.5619 0.2808 2.6148 0.1800 2.4311 0.1800 2.5140

GAL 0.4157 3.1403 0.3857 3.2002 0.1800 2.9046 0.1800 2.9945

History Total 8.7324 8.9075 8.2352 8.5003

Split Load 50.0000 50.0000 0.0000 0.0000
Devide by 8000 Gallons 0.0063 0.0063 0.0000 0.0000
History Total 8.7387 8.9138 8.2352 8.5003

Above Ground 70.0000 70.0000 0.0000 0.0000
Devide by 8000 Gallons 0.0088 0.0088 0.0000 0.0000
History Total 8.7412 8.9163 8.2352 8.5003

Opis low On Road Unleanded Off Road
Feb-23 3.1022 2.3437 3.1072
May-23 2.5968 2.3290 2.6025
Jun-23 2.5709 2.3070 2.5763
Jul-23 2.6983 2.4688 2.7033
Dec-23 2.6270 1.9722 2.6322
Jan-24 2.7212 2.0861 2.7262
Average 2.7194 2.2511 2.7246

Opis 
Average 

On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.2308 2.4026 3.2306
May-23 2.6669 2.3952 2.6724
Jun-23 2.6835 2.3684 2.6906
Jul-23 2.7753 2.5353 2.7753
Dec-23 2.6967 2.1042 2.6990
Jan-24 2.8177 2.1985 2.8190
Average 2.8118 2.3340 2.8145

Price 
Ranking

1 2 3

Additional Drop Charge for tank wagon 
delivery

6 Gross No.2 Red-Dyed Fuel (Off 
Road) less than 7500 gallons

1 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel less than 
7500 gallons

Colonial Oil Industries, Inc. Gentry Oil, LLC

Line Item Fuel Type

4 E-10 Fuel less than 8000 gallons

Will charge additional $100.00 for any 
load under 100 Gallons
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County of Volusia, FL Recommendation of Award
Solicitation # and Title: 24-B-61LS Bulk Fuel

Solicitation Closing Date and Time: March 19, 2024, 3:00 PM
Small Loads OPIS Low and Average

Unit of 
Measure

GAL

GAL

GAL

History Total

Split Load
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Above Ground
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Opis low On Road Unleanded Off Road
Feb-23 3.1022 2.3437 3.1072
May-23 2.5968 2.3290 2.6025
Jun-23 2.5709 2.3070 2.5763
Jul-23 2.6983 2.4688 2.7033
Dec-23 2.6270 1.9722 2.6322
Jan-24 2.7212 2.0861 2.7262
Average 2.7194 2.2511 2.7246

Opis 
Average 

On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.2308 2.4026 3.2306
May-23 2.6669 2.3952 2.6724
Jun-23 2.6835 2.3684 2.6906
Jul-23 2.7753 2.5353 2.7753
Dec-23 2.6967 2.1042 2.6990
Jan-24 2.8177 2.1985 2.8190
Average 2.8118 2.3340 2.8145

Price 
Ranking

1 2 3

6 Gross No.2 Red-Dyed Fuel (Off 
Road) less than 7500 gallons

1 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel less than 
7500 gallons

Line Item Fuel Type

4 E-10 Fuel less than 8000 gallons

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

0.5815 3.3009 0.5815 3.3933 0.1700 2.8894 0.1100 2.9218 0.3200 3.0394 0.3000 3.1118

0.5315 2.7826 0.5315 2.8655 0.1700 2.4211 0.1100 2.4440 0.3300 2.5811 0.3000 2.6340

0.5720 3.2966 0.5720 3.3865 0.1700 2.8946 0.1100 2.9245 0.5500 3.2746 0.2500 3.0645

9.3802 9.6453 8.2052 8.2903 8.8952 8.8103

50.0000 50.0000 0.0000 0.0000 40.0000 40.0000
0.0063 0.0063 0.0000 0.0000 0.0050 0.0050
9.3865 9.6516 8.2052 8.2903 8.9002 8.8153

0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 50.0000 50.0000
0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0000 0.0063 0.0063
9.3802 9.6453 8.2052 8.2903 8.9015 8.8166

Additional Drop Charge for tank wagon 
delivery

Greens Energy James River SolutionsGlobal Montello Group Corp.

Will charge additional $60.00 for every 
load and that will change the overall 

price per gallon depending on quanty. 
The max small load will be 3000 gallons, 

which would be $.02 more per gallon
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County of Volusia, FL Recommendation of Award
Solicitation # and Title: 24-B-61LS Bulk Fuel

Solicitation Closing Date and Time: March 19, 2024, 3:00 PM
Small Loads OPIS Low and Average

Unit of 
Measure

GAL

GAL

GAL

History Total

Split Load
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Above Ground
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Opis low On Road Unleanded Off Road
Feb-23 3.1022 2.3437 3.1072
May-23 2.5968 2.3290 2.6025
Jun-23 2.5709 2.3070 2.5763
Jul-23 2.6983 2.4688 2.7033
Dec-23 2.6270 1.9722 2.6322
Jan-24 2.7212 2.0861 2.7262
Average 2.7194 2.2511 2.7246

Opis 
Average 

On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.2308 2.4026 3.2306
May-23 2.6669 2.3952 2.6724
Jun-23 2.6835 2.3684 2.6906
Jul-23 2.7753 2.5353 2.7753
Dec-23 2.6967 2.1042 2.6990
Jan-24 2.8177 2.1985 2.8190
Average 2.8118 2.3340 2.8145

Price 
Ranking

1 2 3

6 Gross No.2 Red-Dyed Fuel (Off 
Road) less than 7500 gallons

1 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel less than 
7500 gallons

Line Item Fuel Type

4 E-10 Fuel less than 8000 gallons

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

0.3700 3.0894 0.3000 3.1118 0.2914 3.0108 0.2074 3.0192 0.2290 2.9484 0.1890 3.0008

0.3700 2.6211 0.3000 2.6340 0.2593 2.5104 0.1866 2.5206 0.2290 2.4801 0.1890 2.5230

0.3700 3.0946 0.3000 3.1145 0.2442 2.9688 0.1625 2.9770 No Bid No Bid No Bid No bid

8.8052 8.8603 8.4901 8.5168 5.5238

0.0100 0.0100 50.0000 50.0000 0.0000 0.0000
0.0000 0.0000 0.0063 0.0063 0.0000 0.0000
8.4352 8.8603 8.4964 8.5231 0.0000 5.5238

0.0000 0.0000 70.0000 70.0000 0.0000 0.0000
0.0000 0.0000 0.0088 0.0088 0.0000 0.0000
8.8052 8.8603 8.4989 8.5256 0.0000 5.5238

Mansfield Oil Company of Gainesville, 
Inc.

Palmdale Oil CompanyLynch Oil
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County of Volusia, FL Recommendation of Award
Solicitation # and Title: 24-B-61LS Bulk Fuel

Solicitation Closing Date and Time: March 19, 2024, 3:00 PM
Small Loads OPIS Low and Average

Unit of 
Measure

GAL

GAL

GAL

History Total

Split Load
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Above Ground
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Opis low On Road Unleanded Off Road
Feb-23 3.1022 2.3437 3.1072
May-23 2.5968 2.3290 2.6025
Jun-23 2.5709 2.3070 2.5763
Jul-23 2.6983 2.4688 2.7033
Dec-23 2.6270 1.9722 2.6322
Jan-24 2.7212 2.0861 2.7262
Average 2.7194 2.2511 2.7246

Opis 
Average 

On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.2308 2.4026 3.2306
May-23 2.6669 2.3952 2.6724
Jun-23 2.6835 2.3684 2.6906
Jul-23 2.7753 2.5353 2.7753
Dec-23 2.6967 2.1042 2.6990
Jan-24 2.8177 2.1985 2.8190
Average 2.8118 2.3340 2.8145

Price 
Ranking

1 2 3

6 Gross No.2 Red-Dyed Fuel (Off 
Road) less than 7500 gallons

1 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel less than 
7500 gallons

Line Item Fuel Type

4 E-10 Fuel less than 8000 gallons

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

0.5900 3.3094 0.5000 3.3118 0.3721 3.0915 0.2846 3.0964 0.4043 3.1237 0.3543 3.1661

0.5900 2.8411 0.5000 2.8340 0.3402 2.5913 0.2295 2.5635 0.3810 2.6321 0.3310 2.6650

0.5900 3.3146 0.5000 3.3145 0.3745 3.0991 0.2904 3.1049 0.4043 3.1289 0.3543 3.1688

9.4652 9.4603 8.7820 8.7648 8.8848 8.9999

75.0000 75.0000 65.0000 65.0000 35.0000 35.0000
0.0094 0.0094 0.0081 0.0081 0.0044 0.0044
9.4746 9.4697 8.7901 8.7729 8.8892 9.0043

100.0000 100.0000 75.0000 75.0000 75.0000 75.0000
0.0125 0.0125 0.0094 0.0094 0.0094 0.0094
9.4777 9.4728 8.7914 8.7742 8.8942 9.0093

Saratoga Rack Marketing LLCPinnacle Petroleum, Inc.Petroleum Traders Corporation
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County of Volusia, FL Recommendation of Award
Solicitation # and Title: 24-B-61LS Bulk Fuel

Solicitation Closing Date and Time: March 19, 2024, 3:00 PM
Small Loads OPIS Low and Average

Unit of 
Measure

GAL

GAL

GAL

History Total

Split Load
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Above Ground
Devide by 8000 Gallons
History Total

Opis low On Road Unleanded Off Road
Feb-23 3.1022 2.3437 3.1072
May-23 2.5968 2.3290 2.6025
Jun-23 2.5709 2.3070 2.5763
Jul-23 2.6983 2.4688 2.7033
Dec-23 2.6270 1.9722 2.6322
Jan-24 2.7212 2.0861 2.7262
Average 2.7194 2.2511 2.7246

Opis 
Average 

On Road Unleanded Off Road

Feb-23 3.2308 2.4026 3.2306
May-23 2.6669 2.3952 2.6724
Jun-23 2.6835 2.3684 2.6906
Jul-23 2.7753 2.5353 2.7753
Dec-23 2.6967 2.1042 2.6990
Jan-24 2.8177 2.1985 2.8190
Average 2.8118 2.3340 2.8145

Price 
Ranking

1 2 3

6 Gross No.2 Red-Dyed Fuel (Off 
Road) less than 7500 gallons

1 Ultra Low Sulfur Diesel less than 
7500 gallons

Line Item Fuel Type

4 E-10 Fuel less than 8000 gallons

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 
daily low

Adding Opis 
Low History 

Cost

Markup 
over OPIS 

daily 
average

Adding OPIS 
Average 

History Cost

0.5000 3.2194 0.5000 3.3118 0.3000 3.0194 0.2500 3.0618

0.5000 2.7511 0.5000 2.8340 0.3000 2.5511 0.2500 2.5840

0.5000 3.2246 0.5000 3.3145 0.3000 3.0246 0.2500 3.0645

9.1952 9.4603 8.5952 8.7103

50.0000 50.0000 0.0000 0.0000
0.0063 0.0063 0.0000 0.0000
9.2015 9.4666 8.5952 8.7103

55.0000 55.0000 0.0000 0.0000
0.0069 0.0069 0.0000 0.0000
9.2021 9.4672 8.5952 8.7103

Sunoco, LLC Tropic Oil Company
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